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Parvana
Parvana is a strong protagonist, she really adjust to what is happening, Here are a 
few characteristics.

She is strong physically and emotionally. For example she lost her father and 
knew she had to pick herself back up to support her family. This takes real 
strength.

She is very clever. For example she dressed up as a boy so she could get a job 
and go to the store. I think this was very smart.

She is caring, she is always wanting to help. For example she went to the poor girl 
and felt for her and took her in and helped her gain her strength back.



Dr Peyton Shaw (Peyton)
Peyton is a lot like Parvana, She is a doctor and has to be able to adapt like the 
wind. Here are some other characteristics, 

 She is like parvana strong, She can get up at 2:00 am to help the sick. She will do 
this kind of thing every day, and do it until 1:30am even if its a unknown disease 
that could be very harmful. I think this takes real strength.  

She is very talented in her work, She is a first global responder. She has taken 
many years of school and knows how to handle situations.

She is a very good protagonist she will not just do what the plot says like a 
mindless robot. With the things listed above I think I have proven this one.



Evidence in more detail  
In Chapter 14, Breadwinner Parvana helped a tired and hungry girl not much older 
than her and let her stay in her house until she could get her strength and Burqa 
back. I think this shows how strong Parvana’s identity and character is.

In Pandemic Peyton was the first to respond to the disease that she had no idea 
how dangerous it was, But she helped because she is a great person with a strong 
identity and character. 



My opinion
In reading these two books I have made a conclusion that the author of The 
Breadwinner is more interested in expressing charetars identity, and real world 
problems. But the author of “Pandemic” focuses more on the story rather than 
character development and identity.



In conclusion,
Reading these books I was put in a perspective I couldn't imagine. The characters 
really changed the way I see how easy my life is compared to other people’s lives. 
I never thought anyone would have to pretend to be someone they are not to feed 
their family. Or have to deal with situations that could be lethal in order to save 
lives and how hard it can actually be for others. After reading these I won't take the 
little luxuries in life for granted.


